
Judicial Independence
Introduction

The judiciary is one of three branches of government in Canada: executive, legislative and
judicial. Each of these branches has responsibilities rooted in Canada’s Constitution and
history. Judicial independence is foundational to the constitutional role of the judiciary.
Courts must be “completely independent of any other entity,” including other branches of
government, social groups, and individuals.[1] A court must not only be independent, the
public must also see it as independent. [2]

The Importance of Judicial Independence

Judicial  independence  ensures  that  the  judiciary  can  properly  exercise  its  judicial
responsibilities.  That  includes  adjudicating  individual  disputes.  Judges  should  make
decisions  “based  solely  on  the  requirements  of  law  and  justice.”[3]

The judiciary is also the protector of the Constitution and the values it embodies.[4] These
values include the rule of law, democracy, equality, and fundamental justice.[5] Two sources
make the judiciary the protector of the Constitution. First, Canada is a federal country,
meaning it has two levels of government: central and provincial. Sections 91 and 92 of
the Constitution Act, 1867 give different powers to these levels of government. A federal
system requires an independent arbiter (the judiciary) to resolve disputes between the two
levels of government.[6] Second, the judiciary is responsible for protecting our basic human
rights contained in the Canadian Charter of Rights and Freedoms,  which is part of the
Canadian Constitution. An independent judiciary protects us against government action that
violates these rights.[7]

The importance of judicial independence for protecting the Constitution is also tied to the
principle  of  separation  of  powers.  Separation  of  powers  means  that  the  branches  of
government  should  be  independent  of  one another.[8]  Each of  the  branches  exercises
separate and distinct functions that the other branches cannot interfere with. However, this
does not mean that each of the branches is completely separate from the other.

The branches of government have a particular relationship with one another based on their
functions.[9] The Supreme Court of Canada has said that the relationship between the
judiciary and the other branches is a depoliticized one. This means that the legislature and
executive cannot put political pressure on the judiciary, and the judiciary should not speak
publicly on issues that could come before the courts.[10]

Finally, judicial independence is essential for upholding the rule of law, which means that
governments can only take actions that are permitted by law and the Constitution. [11] The
judiciary makes sure that government actions and laws are consistent with the Constitution.
An  independent  judiciary  maintains  public  confidence  that  justice  will  be  done  by  an
impartial authority.[12]

https://www.constitutionalstudies.ca/2019/07/judicial-independence/
https://www.constitutionalstudies.ca/index.php/constitutional-issues/democratic-governance/818-the-constitution-and-canada-s-branches-of-government
https://www.constitutionalstudies.ca/index.php/pr/540-rule-of-law


Judicial Independence: Two Dimensions and Three Characteristics

Judicial  independence  has  two  dimensions:  individual  and  institutional.  Individual
i ndependence  means  tha t  i nd i v i dua l  j udges  dec ide  cases  w i thou t
interference.[13] Institutional independence means that courts are independent from other
branches of government.[14]

Three  core  characteristics  –  security  of  tenure,  financial  security,  and  administrative
independence – are necessary for maintaining judicial independence.[15]

Security of tenure means that judges cannot be removed on a whim. Judges are appointed
until retirement, unless they cannot perform their duties.[16]

Financial security means that judges’ salaries are set by law, and the executive cannot
change them.[17] It also means that courts must be “free from political interference through
economic  manipulation  by  the  other  branches  of  government.”[18]  For  example,  if  a
provincial government wants to change or freeze the salaries of provincial court judges, it
must set up an effective and independent commission to determine whether that can be
done.[19] Otherwise, if a provincial government were to unilaterally change the salaries of
provincial court judges, then it would be interfering with the financial security of provincial
court judges. If a provincial government interfered with the financial security of judges, it
would be interfering with judicial independence.

Administrative independence  means that courts have control  over their  own judicial
administration. This includes assigning judges to cases, court sittings, and direction over
administrative staff.[20]

Sources of Judicial Independence

Judicial independence has two sources explicitly written into the Constitution. Sections 96 –
100  of  the  Constitution  Act,  1867  guarantee  the  highest  degree  of  independence  for
superior  courts.  This  includes security  of  tenure,  salary  and pension.  Section 11(d)  of
the  Charter  guarantees  the  right  to  an  “independent  and  impartial  body”  for  every
individual accused of an offence. These sources do not explicitly apply to all courts. For
example, a provincial court dealing with a family law matter does not fall under any of these
sections  because  it  is  not  a  superior  court  (in  other  words,  sections  96-100  of
the Constitution Act do not apply) and is not dealing with a criminal law matter (therefore,
section 11(d) of the Charter does not apply).

That said, judicial independence does apply to all courts because it is an unwritten principle
of our Constitution.[21] The preamble to the Constitution Act, 1867 says that Canada is to
have a Constitution “similar in principle to that of the United Kingdom.” Since judicial
independence  is  an  important  principle  in  the  United  Kingdom’s  Constitution,  it  was
transferred into Canada’s Constitution as an unwritten principle.[22] Over the course of the
Constitution’s history, the principle of judicial independence has evolved to apply to all
courts.[23]  Without  this  principle,  some  courts  might  not  be  protected  from  outside



interference.

The content of judicial independence is also a product of the political realm.[24] This means
that the “day-to-day processes of negotiation and interaction” between members of the
political  and  legal  system  determine  how  judicial  independence  is  implemented.  For
example, the Constitution Act, 1867 contains provisions for appointing judges and setting
their salaries. These provisions relate to judicial independence, but the way that they are
implemented is partially a product of the political process.[25]

The requirement for provinces to set up an independent commission to change the salaries
of provincial court judges is an example of this political process. Provincial governments can
make a political decision to adjust the salaries of provincial judges depending on economic
circumstances.  But  the  Supreme Court  of  Canada  has  mandated  that  an  independent
commission must be met for this happen. Here we have an interplay between the branches
of government in determining how one aspect of judicial independence (financial security)
should be dealt with.

Judicial Appointments and Independence

The politics of judicial independence can be seen clearly in the process by which judges are
appointed. The Constitution gives the Governor General authority to appoint judges to trial
and appeal courts. However, the Constitution does not provide for a process of appointment.
In practice, the minister of justice selects a candidate from a list compiled after consultation
with other judges and members of the legal profession. The minister then recommends the
candidate to the federal cabinet, which includes the prime minister.[26] Qualifications for
appointment of these judges can be found in section 3 of the Judges Act. If the appointment
process for appointing judges is not open or transparent, those appointments might seem
like political choices.

Does judicial independence require an open process for judicial appointments to avoid the
perception  that  those  appointments  are  based  on  political  preference  or  interference?
Perhaps, an independent commission should be required to appoint judges in the same way
that an independent commission is needed to change judges’ salaries.[27] This issue will
likely receive more attention in the coming years.

Conclusion

Judicial independence is essential to the rule of law and to the effective functioning of our
democracy. It  must be safeguarded to ensure that the public remains confident in the
judiciary. If the public loses confidence in the judiciary’s independence, it might also lose
faith in our justice system.
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